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Message from the Director 

TONIGHT WE IMPROVISE. What is it about? It is about an onion or 
rather, it is layered like an onion and I hope that we have uncovered 
some of its mysteries. Like Dr. Hinkfuss, the director of this evening's 
entertainment, I have found myself questioning both the meaning of art 
and the magic of the living theatre. I hope you will also revel in the 
dilemma presented in this fascinating piece of work. 

At the time of these notes I have been lucky enough not to have been 
expelled by the acting compay and I am continually thankful that I have 
had the opportunity to work with the dedicated students of the 
Department of Theatre. As you will witness, this is a large show in all 
areas and the wonder is that while we have spent the last six weeks in 
intensive rehearsal these student actors are also busy with electives, 
graduation photos and the continuing challenge of determining how to 
enter, with a healthy and realistic attitude, this demanding profession . 

I have great admiration for the graduating class and shall miss them 
enormously. I am deeply indebted to the stage management team on 
this show, especially Judy Joe, Michael and Stephen . I look forward to 
the wonderful possibilities ahead for the second year acting students , 

. and I thank the assistant director, Kim Collins and the student assistant 
director, Michael Cowie, who has been a positive influence from the 
beginning . 

We are delighted that you have come to experience this show with us 
and to conclude, let me share some T-shirt philosophy which seems 
particularly pertinent to this evening prepared by your director, Or. 
Hinkfuss : 

REALITY IS FOR THOSE WHO LACK IMAGINATION. 
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ANNOUNCING 

DTDP's 1993-94 season of four productions will be chosen from the 
following, subject to change: 

THE SUICIDE, by Nicolai Erdman 
Stalin's Russia : Semyon can't find a job and suicide seems as logical a 
solution to his problem as any other. But word gets out, the community 
wants input, and before he knows what happens his life is out of his 
hands ... banned by Stalin in 1930, this provocative farce takes a swipe 
at all bureaucratic pretension : no one escapes! 

THE ART OF SUCCESS, by Nick Dear 
A dark, satirical portrait of William Hogarth's England , and of the great 
artist himself, which contains disturbing tones of our own world . 
Through poverty, corruption of all kinds, censorship and coercion, 
Hogarth struggles to be a businesslike artist without losing his integrity. 
On the leading edge of the new wave of British playwrights, Nick Dear 
has received international acclaim for this fantastical collision of artistic, 
sexual and political bodies . 

RUNAWAYS, by Elizabeth Swados 
Kids who run away from home often become invisible and voiceless, 
caught in a crippling cycle of emotional ecomomic poverty. This 
musical, written by Swados in collaboration with homeless kids, gives 
their perspective on the city, and gives them a voice which is 
surprisingly wise about tragedy. 

A MIDSUMMER NIGHT'S DREAM, by William Shakespeare 
Courtship , that strange and palpitating ritual which occurs among faeries 
and mortals alike, often meets with impediments , but none so strange as 
those devised by William Shakespeare in his most popular and delightful 
comedy. 

THE LOVE OF THE NIGHTINGALE, by Timberlake Wertenbaker 
Love has many faces which , sometimes incredibly, share the same 
name. Two sisters of ancient Greece are separated when the elder is 
placed in a political marriage a great distance away. Her husband is 
afflicted by Venus with a terrible obsessive love, and the sisters' bond is 
threatened by an ideological hostility more permanent than marriage, 
distance, or death itself. Timberlake Wertenbaker is the highly 
acclaimed author of OUR COUNTRY'S GOOD. 

RED NOSES, BLACK PLAGUE, by Peter Barnes 
How would you react in the face of imminent death? In an all too 
familiar parable about a chaotic medieval world devastated by epidemic, 
Barnes suggests that laughter is the only remaining act of individual 
freedom. A rich, intelligent play that forces us to re-evaluate our own 
prejudices and yet never ceases to entertain. 

JACQUES BREL IS ALIVE AND WELL AND LIVING IN PARIS, 
adaptation by Eric Blau and Mort Shuman 
The timeless review of Brel's music has captured the effectiveness of a 
whole new generation. A journey through all the stages of life with a 
haunting melody and biting lyrics, JACQUES BREL is a classic of the 
musical stage. 

AN EVENING OF ONE-ACT PLAYS, by Arthur Kopit 
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